
 
                      (Summary published in The Salina Journal on July ____2017) 

(Published on the City of Salina’s website for a minimum of one week from July  ___ to ___, 2017) 

ORDINANCE NO. 17-10892 

 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 8, ARTICLE I, DIVISIONS 2, 4 AND 6 OF THE 

SALINA CODE BY REPEALING THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION 

CODE (IECC), 2012 EDITION, BY REFERENCE; AND LOCAL AMENDMENTS, AND 

ADOPTING AND INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE INTERNATIONAL 

ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE (IECC), 2009 EDITION; AND LOCAL 

AMENDMENTS, AND AMENDING SECTIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL 

RESIDENTIAL CODE (IRC), 2012 EDITION, AND THE UNIFORM MECHANICAL 

CODE (UMC), 2012 EDITION.                          

BE IT ORDAINED by the Governing Body of the City of Salina Kansas: 

Section 1.  Amendment.  Section 8-1-6-1 of the Salina Code of Ordinances.  Section 8-1-6-1 of the 

Salina code is hereby amended to read as follows:  

 8-1-6-1 International Energy Conservation Code adopted. 

The 2009 Edition of the International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, promulgated 

and published by the International Code Council is incorporated by reference, except as 

amended in this division.  

Section 2.  Repealer.  Sections 8-1-6-C101.1 and 8-1-6C402.2 are repealed.  

Section 3.  New Section.   The Salina Code is amended by adding a new section to Chapter 8, 

Article I, Division 6 to be numbered 8-1-6-101.5.2 which section reads as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-101.5.2 Amendment to Section 101.5.2 of the IECC. 

Section 101.5.2 of the International Energy Conservation Code is hereby amended by adding a 

new Section 101.5.2 to read as follows: 

Section 101.5.2 Low energy buildings. The following buildings, or portions thereof, separated 

from the remainder of the building by building thermal envelope assemblies complying with this 

code shall be exempt from the building thermal envelope provisions of this code:  

a. Those with a peak design rate of energy usage less than 15 Btu/hr per square foot or 4.4 

watts per square foot of floor area for space conditioning purposes.  

b. Those that do not contain conditioned space.  

Section 4.  New Section.   The Salina Code is amended by adding a new section to Chapter 8, 

Article I, Division 6 to be numbered 8-1-6-402.2.7 which section reads as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-402.2.7 Amendment to Section 402.2.7 of the IECC.  

Section 402.2.7 of the International Energy Conservation Code is hereby amended as follows:  

Section 402.2.7 Basement walls. Walls associated with basements shall be insulated, at the 

time of basement finish, from the top of the basement wall down to 10 feet (3048 mm) below 

grade or to the basement floor, whichever is less.  

 



Section 5.  New Section.   The Salina Code is amended by adding a new section to Chapter 8, 

Article I, Division 6 to be numbered 8-1-6-402.2.8 which section reads as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-402.2.8 Amendment to Section 402.2.8 of the IECC.  

Section 8-1-6-402.2.8 of the International Energy Conservation Code is hereby amended as 

follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-402.2.8.  Deleted 

Section 6.  New Section.   The Salina Code is amended by adding a new section to Chapter 8, 

Article I, Division 6 to be numbered 8-1-6-502.2.1 which section reads as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-502.2.1 Amendment to Section 502.2.1 of the IECC.  

Sec. 8-1-6-502.2.1 of the International Energy Conservation Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows:  

Section 502.2.1 Roof assembly. The minimum thermal resistance (R-value) of the insulating 

material installed either between the roof framing or continuously on the roof assembly shall be 

as specified in Table 502.2(1), based on construction materials used in the roof assembly.  

Exception: Metal building roofs where spacer blocks are not readily available from the building 

manufacturer for the type of roof covering installed as long as the base R-value specified in 

Table 502.2(1) is maintained.  

Section 7.  New Section.   The Salina Code is amended by adding a new section to Chapter 8, 

Article I, Division 6 to be numbered 8-1-6-502.2.4 which section reads as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-502.2.4 Amendment to Section 502.2.4 of the IECC.  

Sec. 8-1-6-502.2.4 of the International Energy Conservation Code is hereby changed to read as 

follows:  

Section 502.2.4 Below-grade walls. Walls associated with basements shall be insulated, at the 

time of basement finish, from the top of the basement wall down to 10 feet (3048 mm) below 

grade or to the basement floor, whichever is less.  

Section 8.  New Section.   The Salina Code is amended by adding a new section to Chapter 8, 

Article I, Division 6 to be numbered 8-1-6-502.2.6 which section reads as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-502.2.4 Amendment to Section 502.2.6 of the IECC. 

Section 8-1-6-502.2.6.  Deleted.  

Section 9.  New Section.   The Salina Code is amended by adding a new section to Chapter 8, 

Article I, Division 6 to be numbered 8-1-6-505.1 which section reads as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-6-505.1 Amendment to Section 505.1 of the IECC. 

Section 8-1-6-505.1 of the International Energy Conservation Code is hereby changed to read as 

follows:  

Section 505.1 General. This section covers lighting system controls, the connection of ballasts, 

the maximum lighting power for interior applications and the minimum acceptable lighting 



equipment for exterior applications.  

Exception: Lighting where 50 percent or more of the permanently installed light fixtures are 

fitted with high efficiency lamps. 

Section 10. Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-2-N1102.1 is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

Sec. 8-1-2-N1102.1 Amendment to Section N1102.1 of the IRC. 

Section 8-1-2-N1102.1.  Deleted 

Section 11. Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-2-N1102.4 is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

Sec. 8-1-2-N1102.4 Amendment to Section N1102.4 of the IRC. 

Section 8-1-2-N1102.4.  Deleted 

Section 12. Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-2-N1102.4.1.1 is hereby amended to read 

as follows: 

Sec. 8-1-2-N1102.4.1.1 Amendment to Section N1102.4.1.1 of the IRC. 

Section 8-1-2-N1102.4.1.1.  Deleted 

Section 13. Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-2-N1103.2.2 is hereby amended to read as 

follows:  

 Sec. 8-1-2-N1103.2.2 Amendment to Section N1103.2.2 of the IRC. 

 Section 8-1-2-N1103.2.2.  Deleted 

Section 14. Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-2-N1103.2.3 is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

 Sec. 8-1-2-N1103.2.3 Amendment to Section N1103.2.3 of the IRC. 

 Section 8-1-2-N1103.2.3.  Deleted 

Section 15. Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-2-N1103.5 is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

 Sec. 8-1-2-N1103.5 Amendment to Section N1103.5 of the IRC. 

 Section 8-1-2-N1103.5  Deleted 

Section 16. Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-2-N1104.1 is hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

 Sec. 8-1-2-N1104.1 Amendment to Section N1104.1 of the IRC. 

 Section 8-1-2-N1104.1.  Deleted 

 

Section 17.  Amendment. The Salina Code, Section 8-1-4-1 is hereby amended to read as follows:   



 

 Sec. 8-1-1-4-1 Amendment to Section 8-1-4-1. 

 

Section 8-1-4-1 Uniform Mechanical Code adopted. The Uniform Mechanical Code, 2012 

Edition (UMC) promulgated and published by the International Association of Plumbing 

and Mechanical Officials, but not any other of its appendices, is adopted and incorporated 

by reference, except as amended in this division. 

 

Section 18.  Repealer.   Sections 8-1-6-C101.1 and 8-1-6C402.2 are repealed   

 

Section 19. Effective. That this ordinance shall be in full force on July 24, 2017 after its adoption 

and publication once in the official city newspaper by the following summary: 

         

                     Ordinance No. 17-10872 Summary 

On July 17, 2017 the City Commission passed Ordinance No. 17-10892.  The Ordinance repeals 

Chapter 8, Article I of the Salina Code, Division 6; adopts and incorporates the 2009 edition of 

the International Energy Conservation Code by reference; and adopts local amendments with an 

effective date of July 24, 2017.   A complete copy of the ordinance can be found at www.salina-

ks.gov or in the office of the City Clerk, 300 W Ash Street, free of charge. This summary is 

certified by the City’s legal counsel. 

 

       Introduced: July 17, 2017 

       Passed: July 24, 2017 

 

       ___________________________________ 

Kaye J. Crawford, Mayor 

[SEAL] 

ATTEST: 

______________________________ 

Shandi Wicks, CMC, City Clerk 

 

Certification of Publication Summary: 

____________________________ 
Greg Bengtson, Legal Counsel 


